VILLAGE OF HUNTLEY Route 47 Water Main Replacement
CBBEL PROJ. #07103-00100

c/lo GJS

BID OPENING 8/25/2022 @ 10:00 AM

BID OPENING RESULTS

NO. PLAN HOLDER NAME Sigggg dBid CXQECQZS gi%lm
Amount
Engineer’s Estimate $1,347,650.00

1. | A Lamp Concrete Contractors, Inc. No Bid Submitted
2. | Alliance Contractors Inc. No Bid Submitted
3. | Benchmark Construction v v $1,538,368.00 $1,538,368.00
4. | Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc. No Bid Submitted
5. | H. Linden & Sons Sewer and Water, Inc. No Bid Submitted
6. | Joel Kennedy Constructing Corp. \/ \/ $1,641,995.00 $1,641,995.00
7. | Mauro Sewer Construction, Inc. No Bid Submitted
8. | Martam Construction, Inc. v v $1,414,158.00 $1,414,158.00€
9. | Trine Construction Corp. v Not Submitted $1,357,095.50 $1,357,097.50
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CHRISTOPHER B. BURKE ENGINEERING, LTD.
PREPARED BY: GJS

VILLAGE OF HUNTLEY
IL Rt. 47 Watermain Replacement
CBBEL PROJECT NO.070103.00100

Bid Tabulation

BID OPENING
DATE: August 25, 2022
TIME: 10:00 AM
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE TRINE CONSTRUCTION CORP. MARTAM CONSTRUCTION INC. BENCHMARK CONSTRUCTION ROEL KENNE%;:SNSTRUCTING
ITEM NUMBER ITEM UNIT QUANTITY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
20100110 TREE REMOVAL (6 TO 15 UNITS DIAMETER) UNIT 110 75.00 8,250.00 57.50 6,325.00 55.00 6,050.00 50.00 5,500.00 50.00 5,500.00
20100210 TREE REMOVAL (OVER 15 UNITS DIAMETER) UNIT 70 75.00 5,250.00 69.00 4,830.00 66.00 4,620.00 60.00 4,200.00 60.00 4,200.00
20101200 TREE ROOT PRUNING EACH 8 250.00 2,000.00 143.75 1,150.00 183.00 1,464.00 125.00 1,000.00 235.00 1,880.00
20101300 TREE PRUNING (1 TO 10 INCH DIAMETER) EACH 6 250.00 1,500.00 230.00 1,380.00 250.00 1,500.00 200.00 1,200.00 175.00 1,050.00
20101350 TREE PRUNING (OVER 10 INCH DIAMETER) EACH 2 250.00 500.00 287.50 575.00 311.00 622.00 250.00 500.00 250.00 500.00
*20800150 TRENCH BACKFILL, SPECIAL CUYD 500 35.00 17,500.00 65.05 32,525.00 51.00 25,500.00 53.00 26,500.00 1.00 500.00
*21101615 TOPSOIL FURNISH AND PLACE, 4" SQ YD 6000 8.00 48,000.00 8.35 50,100.00 5.00 30,000.00 4.75 28,500.00 3.00 18,000.00
21301072 EXPLORATION TRENCH 72" DEPTH FOOT 20 50.00 1,000.00 575.00 11,500.00 68.00 1,360.00 200.00 4,000.00 75.00 1,500.00
25000400 NITROGEN FERTILIZER NUTRIENT POUND 110 6.00 660.00 3.45 379.50 1.00 110.00 1.50 165.00 1.00 110.00
25000500 PHOSPHORUS FERTILIZER NUTRIENT POUND 110 6.00 660.00 3.45 379.50 1.00 110.00 1.50 165.00 1.00 110.00
25000600 POTASSIUM FERTILIZER NUTRIENT POUND 110 6.00 660.00 3.45 379.50 1.00 110.00 1.50 165.00 1.00 110.00
*25000110 SEEDING, CLASS 1, SPECIAL ACRE 1.25 15,000.00 18,750.00 4,025.00 5,031.25 37,500.00 46,875.00 1,800.00 2,250.00 8,000.00 10,000.00
*25100630 EROSION CONTROL BLANKET, NETLESS SQ YD 6000 5.00 30,000.00 1.35 8,100.00 1.10 6,600.00 3.15 18,900.00 2.40 14,400.00
25200200 SUPPLEMENTAL WATERING UNIT 10 150.00 1,500.00 115.00 1,150.00 1.00 10.00 150.00 1,500.00 10.00 100.00
*28000510 INLET FILTERS EACH 4 200.00 800.00 172.75 691.00 245.00 980.00 130.00 520.00 275.00 1,100.00
40201000 AGGREGATE FOR TEMPORARY ACCESS TON 10 35.00 350.00 18.70 187.00 66.00 660.00 191.00 1,910.00 100.00 1,000.00
*42400200 PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE SIDEWALK 5 INCH, (MODIFIED) SQFT 2000 10.00 20,000.00 10.65 21,300.00 7.50 15,000.00 13.00 26,000.00 12.00 24,000.00
*42400800 DETECTABLE WARNINGS SQFT 20 50.00 1,000.00 26.45 529.00 34.00 680.00 35.00 700.00 75.00 1,500.00
44000500 COMBINATION CURB AND GUTTER REMOVAL FOOT 150 10.00 1,500.00 8.05 1,207.50 16.00 2,400.00 10.00 1,500.00 8.00 1,200.00
44000600 SIDEWALK REMOVAL SQFT 2000 2.00 4,000.00 2.25 4,500.00 2.00 4,000.00 0.50 1,000.00 2.00 4,000.00
*44200966 CLASS B PATCHES, 10 INCH, SPECIAL SQ YD 175 150.00 26,250.00 118.50 20,737.50 241.00 42,175.00 255.00 44,625.00 140.00 24,500.00
*44201713 CLASS D PATCH, 6 INCH, SPECIAL SQ YD 120 55.00 6,600.00 143.75 17,250.00 106.00 12,720.00 200.00 24,000.00 95.00 11,400.00
*550A0050 STORM SEWERS, CLASS A, TYPE 1 12" FOOT 526 95.00 49,970.00 82.10 43,184.60 74.00 38,924.00 125.00 65,750.00 120.00 63,120.00
*56100600 WATER MAIN 6" FOOT 70 91.00 6,370.00 102.05 7,143.50 146.00 10,220.00 120.00 8,400.00 95.00 6,650.00
*56100700 WATER MAIN 8" FOOT 240 100.00 24,000.00 96.80 23,232.00 122.00 29,280.00 130.00 31,200.00 160.00 38,400.00
*56100900 WATER MAIN 12" FOOT 1750 150.00 262,500.00 111.70 195,475.00 144.00 252,000.00 144.00 252,000.00 183.00 320,250.00
*56104900 WATER VALVES 6" EACH 1 2,000.00 2,000.00 4,190.00 4,190.00 1,910.00 1,910.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,000.00 2,000.00
*56105000 WATER VALVES 8" EACH 3 2,400.00 7,200.00 4,650.00 13,950.00 2,680.00 8,040.00 3,000.00 9,000.00 3,000.00 9,000.00
*56105200 WATER VALVES 12" EACH 7 4,000.00 28,000.00 6,005.00 42,035.00 3,660.00 25,620.00 4,000.00 28,000.00 4,000.00 28,000.00
*56400500 FIRE HYDRANTS TO BE REMOVED EACH 6 800.00 4,800.00 430.00 2,580.00 880.00 5,280.00 3,000.00 18,000.00 400.00 2,400.00
*56400820 FIRE HYDRANT WITH AUXILIARY VALVE AND VALVE BOX 8 7 8,000.00 56,000.00 8,450.50 59,153.50 7,910.00 55,370.00 7,500.00 52,500.00 11,750.00 82,250.00
60200105 CATCH BASINS, TYPE A, 4-DIAMETER, TYPE 1 FRAME, OPEN LID EACH 1 4,000.00 4,000.00 5,330.00 5,330.00 4,120.00 4,120.00 3,000.00 3,000.00 4,800.00 4,800.00
60218400 MANHOLES, TYPE A, 4'-DIAMETER, TYPE 1 FRAME, CLOSED LID EACH 1 3,500.00 3,500.00 5,099.75 5,099.75 4,460.00 4,460.00 4,500.00 4,500.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
*60248700 VALVE VAULTS, TYPE A, 4'-DIAMETER, TYPE 1 FRAME, CLOSED LID, SPECIAL EACH 3 3,200.00 9,600.00 5,045.00 15,135.00 4,180.00 12,540.00 4,000.00 12,000.00 5,800.00 17,400.00
*60248900 VALVE VAULTS, TYPE A, 5'-DIAMETER, TYPE 1 FRAME, CLOSED LID, SPECIAL EACH 7 3,800.00 26,600.00 5,765.00 40,355.00 5,220.00 36,540.00 4,500.00 31,500.00 6,500.00 45,500.00
*60604300 COMBINATION CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER FOOT 150 55.00 8,250.00 40.25 6,037.50 39.00 5,850.00 60.00 9,000.00 45.00 6,750.00
66900200 NON-SPECIAL WASTE DISPOSAL CUYD 50 100.00 5,000.00 100.00 5,000.00 106.00 5,300.00 100.00 5,000.00 95.00 4,750.00
67100100 MOBILIZATION L. SUM 1 30,000.00 30,000.00 76,350.00 76,350.00 65,000.00 65,000.00 92,280.00 92,280.00 95,000.00 95,000.00
70400100 TEMPORARY CONCRETE BARRIER FOOT 400 50.00 20,000.00 28.75 11,500.00 41.00 16,400.00 25.00 10,000.00 40.00 16,000.00
70400200 RELOCATE TEMPORARY CONCRETE BARRIER FOOT 400 25.00 10,000.00 10.35 4,140.00 11.00 4,400.00 9.00 3,600.00 15.00 6,000.00
70600240 IMPACT ATTENUATORS, TEMPORARY (NON- REDIRECTIVE), TEST LEVEL 2 EACH 5 1,500.00 7,500.00 1,725.00 8,625.00 1,800.00 9,000.00 1,500.00 7,500.00 3,500.00 17,500.00
78008230 POLYUREA PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE | - LINE 6" FOOT 150 15.00 2,250.00 11.50 1,725.00 25.00 3,750.00 30.00 4,500.00 20.00 3,000.00
78008270 POLYUREA PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE | - LINE 24" FOOT 20 40.00 800.00 18.40 368.00 88.00 1,760.00 120.00 2,400.00 75.00 1,500.00
*X6026622 VALVE VAULTS TO BE ABANDONED EACH 6 500.00 3,000.00 310.00 1,860.00 480.00 2,880.00 700.00 4,200.00 400.00 2,400.00
*X6026632 VALVE BOXES TO BE ABANDONED EACH 2 400.00 800.00 110.00 220.00 310.00 620.00 500.00 1,000.00 250.00 500.00
*X7010216 TRAFFIC CONTROL AND PROTECTION, SPECIAL L. SUM 1 80,000.00 80,000.00 64,900.00 64,900.00 80,000.00 80,000.00 75,000.00 75,000.00 175,000.00 175,000.00
*Z0013798 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT L. SUM 1 9,000.00 9,000.00 5,635.00 5,635.00 6,200.00 6,200.00 7,500.00 7,500.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
*Z0073510 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC SIGNAL TIMING EACH 1 20,000.00 20,000.00 1,437.50 1,437.50 1,600.00 1,600.00 900.00 900.00 1,500.00 1,500.00
*NA AS-BUILT DRAWINGS L. SUM 1 2,500.00 2,500.00 4,025.00 4,025.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 100.00 100.00
*NA DRIVEWAY REMOVAL AND REPLACEMENT SQ YD 150 60.00 9,000.00 86.25 12,937.50 88.00 13,200.00 100.00 15,000.00 95.00 14,250.00
*NA STRUCTURES TO BE ADJUSTED WITH CHIMNEY SEAL EACH 2 1,500.00 3,000.00 950.00 1,900.00 1,220.00 2,440.00 1,000.00 2,000.00 1,000.00 2,000.00
*NA VALVE BOX EACH 1 500.00 500.00 410.50 410.50 480.00 480.00 350.00 350.00 4,000.00 4,000.00
*NA MECHANICALLY PLUG AND BLOCK WATER MAIN EACH 5 1,000.00 5,000.00 2,700.00 13,500.00 1,610.00 8,050.00 4,000.00 20,000.00 750.00 3,750.00
*NA SHUT DOWN CONNECTION TO EXISTING WATER MAIN EACH 4 4,000.00 16,000.00 5,400.00 21,600.00 3,860.00 15,440.00 15,000.00 60,000.00 6,500.00 26,000.00
*NA SHUT DOWN CONNECTION TO EXISTING WATER SERVICE EACH 1 2,500.00 2,500.00 5,400.00 5,400.00 3,320.00 3,320.00 15,000.00 15,000.00 6,500.00 6,500.00
*NA WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT W/NEW BUFFALO BOX, 1.5" FOOT 180 85.00 15,300.00 112.70 20,286.00 94.00 16,920.00 105.00 18,900.00 80.00 14,400.00
*NA WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT W/NEW BUFFALO BOX, SPECIAL, 1" HDPE FOOT 320 85.00 27,200.00 70.65 22,608.00 88.00 28,160.00 100.00 32,000.00 50.00 16,000.00
*NA WATER MAIN FITTINGS LBS 2500 8.00 20,000.00 17.90 44,750.00 9.00 22,500.00 10.00 25,000.00 9.25 23,125.00
*NA WATERMAIN PUSHED IN STEEL CASING, 8" FOOT 358 150.00 53,700.00 57.05 20,423.90 155.00 55,490.00 56.00 20,048.00 110.00 39,380.00
*NA WATERMAIN PUSHED IN STEEL CASING, 12" FOOT 100 175.00 17,500.00 128.50 12,850.00 198.00 19,800.00 96.00 9,600.00 155.00 15,500.00
*NA STEEL CASING PIPE, AUGURED AND JACKED IN PLACE, 16" FOOT 358 510.00 182,580.00 590.75 211,488.50 536.00 191,888.00 680.00 243,440.00 720.00 257,760.00
*NA STEEL CASING PIPE, AUGURED AND JACKED IN PLACE, 24" FOOT 100 600.00 60,000.00 750.50 75,050.00 546.00 54,600.00 765.00 76,500.00 730.00 73,000.00
*NA WATER SERVICE (LEAD) - ASBESTOS ABATEMENT EACH 2 2,000.00 4,000.00 1,725.00 3,450.00 8,800.00 17,600.00 500.00 1,000.00 100.00 200.00
*NA WATER SERVICE (PRIVATE) - LEAD SERVICE REPLACEMENT EACH 2 5,000.00 10,000.00 8,275.00 16,550.00 6,720.00 13,440.00 11,500.00 23,000.00 7,000.00 14,000.00
*NA WATER SERVICE (LEAD) - INTERIOR RESTORATION EACH 2 5,000.00 10,000.00 4,025.00 8,050.00 9,450.00 18,900.00 2,500.00 5,000.00 1,000.00 2,000.00
*NA VIDEOTAPING (INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR) L. SUM 2 500.00 1,000.00 402.50 805.00 4,500.00 9,000.00 500.00 1,000.00 250.00 500.00
*NA SANITARY SEWER, SPECIAL 8" FOOT 20 250.00 5,000.00 57.25 1,145.00 166.00 3,320.00 300.00 6,000.00 160.00 3,200.00
*NA ITEMS AS ORDERED BY THE ENGINEER DOLLAR 25000 1.00 25,000.00 1.00 25,000.00 1.00 25,000.00 1.00 25,000.00 1.00 25,000.00
*SPECIAL PROVISION TOTAL = 1,347,650.00 TOTAL = 1,357,097.50 TOTAL = 1,414,158.00 TOTAL= 1,538,368.00 TOTAL = 1,641,995.00

:Corrected from As-submited
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